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Senior Living



SENIOR LIVING  |  MINDFULNESS

As we age, maintaining 
mental and emotional 

well-being becomes 
increasingly important. 

For seniors, mindfulness 
and meditation offer powerful 
tools to reduce stress, enhance 
overall health and improve 
quality of life. 

These practices, which focus 
on present-moment awareness 
and relaxation, can be easily 
integrated into daily routines. 
Here’s how seniors can benefit 
from mindfulness and medita-
tion, along with tips on getting 
started.

BENEFITS OF 
MINDFULNESS  

AND MEDITATION
Mindfulness and meditation 

help manage stress by encour-
aging a focus on the present 
moment rather than past 
regrets or future worries. This 
shift in focus can lower corti-
sol levels, the body’s primary 
stress hormone, leading to a 
calmer state of mind.

Regular meditation has been 
shown to reduce symptoms of 
anxiety and depression. It pro-
motes emotional health by 
fostering a positive outlook, 
increasing self-awareness and 
improving emotional 
regulation.

Meditation can lead to lower 
blood pressure, improved 
sleep and a strengthened 
immune system. By promoting 
relaxation, it helps reduce the 
physical symptoms associated 
with chronic stress, such as 
muscle tension and headaches.

Mindfulness practices can 
enhance cognitive abilities, 
including memory, attention 
and problem-solving skills. 
This is particularly beneficial 
for seniors, as it helps main-
tain mental sharpness and 
reduces the risk of cognitive 
decline.

GETTING STARTED 
Begin with simple breathing 

exercises. Find a quiet place to 
sit comfortably, close your 
eyes, and focus on your 
breath. Inhale deeply through 
your nose, hold for a moment 
and then exhale slowly 
through your mouth. Concen-
trate on the sensation of 
breathing, letting go of other 
thoughts. Practicing this for 
just five minutes a day can sig-
nificantly reduce stress.

For those new to meditation, 
guided sessions can be very 
helpful. Many apps and online 
resources offer free guided 
meditations tailored for begin-
ners. These sessions provide 
step-by-step instructions, mak-
ing it easier to focus and relax.

This practice involves men-
tally scanning your body from 
head to toe, bringing aware-
ness to each part. Start by 

focusing on your feet, noticing 
any sensations or tension, and 
then gradually move upward. 
This method helps release 
physical tension and enhances 
mind-body connection.

Incorporate mindfulness 
into daily activities. Whether 
it’s eating, walking or garden-
ing, focus entirely on the 
present moment. Notice the 
sights, sounds, smells and tex-
tures around you. This 
practice can transform routine 
tasks into opportunities for 
mindfulness.

Many communities offer 
meditation classes or mindful-
ness groups, often at local 
senior centers or health clubs. 
Joining a group provides social 
interaction and the support of 
others who share similar 
goals.

TIPS FOR MAINTAINING  
A PRACTICE

Begin with short sessions of 
5-10 minutes and gradually 
increase the duration as you 
become more comfortable 
with the practice.

Set aside a specific time 
each day for mindfulness or 
meditation. Consistency helps 
establish a habit and makes 
the practice more effective.

It’s normal for your mind to 
wander during meditation. 
Gently bring your focus back 
to your breath or the present 
moment without judgment.

Books, online courses, and 
apps can provide additional 
guidance and motivation. Con-
sider resources like “The 
Mindfulness Solution” by Ron-
ald D. Siegel or apps like 
Headspace and Calm.

Reduce Stress, Enhance Well-Being 
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SENIOR LIVING  |  READING

While old favorites 
will always provide  

a comforting and 
cozy read, there  

is a never-ending 
supply of new stories. 

Many of them particularly 
captivate seniors, offering a 
perfect blend of entertainment, 
inspiration and intellectual 
engagement. 

Whether you’re looking to 
delve into historical sagas, 
explore thought-provoking 
non-fiction, or lose yourself in a 
thrilling mystery, this year’s lit-
erary offerings have something 
for every taste. 

Reading not only provides a 
delightful escape but also stim-
ulates the mind, enhances 
memory, and promotes mental 
well-being — benefits that are 
especially valuable for seniors. 
From heartwarming tales of 
love and friendship to gripping 
narratives that keep you on the 
edge of your seat, the books of 
2024 promise to enrich your 
reading experience and spark 
meaningful conversations.

Age Space recommends the 
following.

“Redhead by the Side of the 
Road” by Anne Taylor. A mid-
dle-aged man is addicted to his 
routines, all of which get 
upended when a young man 
shows up at his doorstep claim-
ing to be his son. 

“The Fire and the Darkness: 
The Bombing of Dresden 
1945” by Sinclair McKay. This 
historic non-fiction account 
reconstructs one of the most 

devastating bombings of World 
War II from both sides — the 
people living there and the 
Allied bombers.

“Eight Perfect Murders” by 
Peter Swanson. This crime 

thriller has Malcolm, an honest 
bookseller, being asked about a 
series of unsolved mysteries 
that are strikingly similar to a 
list he made in one of his 
novels.

“Milkman” by Anna Burns. 
This Booker-prize winning 
novel is a piece of historic fic-
tion that explores the life of a 
young woman during the Irish 
Troubles.

Freedom Plaza recommends 
the following.

“The Garden of Lost Secrets” 
by Kelly Bowen. Two sisters 
discover the fairy tales their 
great-grandmother	 wrote 
during World War II.

“The Librarianist” by Pat-
rick DeWitt. A retired librarian 
rescues a confused elderly 
woman and starts to volunteer 
at the center where she lives. 
His life and character are 
revealed.

“The Midnight Library” by 
Matt Haig. Nora is given the 
opportunity to trade her life for 
a different one to undo old 
regrets.

“Tom Lake” by Ann Patchett. 
A middle-aged married Michi-
gan cherry farmer tells her 
three adult daughters about the 
summer she dated a man who 
went on to become a famous 
actor.

“When Women Were Drag-
ons” by Kelly Barnhill. This 
fantasy novel is set in the 1950s 
U.S. where thousands of 
women have been transformed 
into dragons. It explores what 
happens when women rise up 
together and take the space 
they deserve.

The Heritage at Lowman rec-
ommends the following.

“Solo Wise: A Roadmap for 
Fearless Solo Aging” by Bev-
erly Bernstein Joie. About 26 
million people are aging alone. 
This book tackles the issues 
related how to navigate the 
future alone.

“The Joy of Aging” by 
Rebekah Luna Chavez. This 
book suggests ways one can 
dance joyfully into the older 
generation.

Great Books for Seniors
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SENIOR LIVING  |  CREATIVE WRITING

Creative writing 
offers seniors a 

powerful tool for self-
expression, personal 
reflection and mental 

stimulation. 

Whether through poetry, 
short stories, memoirs or 
journals, writing allows 
seniors to explore their 
thoughts, memories and emo-
tions in a structured and 
meaningful way. 

WHY CREATIVE WRITING?
Engaging in creative writing 

can help keep the mind sharp. 
Crafting stories and poems 
involves memory, critical 
thinking and creativity, which 
are beneficial for cognitive 
health.

 Writing provides an outlet 
for emotions, helping seniors 
process feelings and experi-
ences. It can be particularly 
therapeutic for those dealing 
with grief, loneliness or 
anxiety.

Writing memoirs or family 
histories allows seniors to 
leave a legacy for future gen-
erations. It’s a way to 
document personal and family 
stories, ensuring they are pre-
served and cherished.

Participating in writing 
groups or classes fosters social 
interaction. Sharing work and 
receiving feedback can create 
a sense of community and 
belonging.

GETTING STARTED
Decide what form of writing 

interests you most. Memoirs 
and autobiographies are great 
for those who want to docu-
ment their life stories. Poetry 
and short stories allow for 
more creative freedom and 
exploration of different 
themes and ideas.

Start small. Set achievable 
goals, such as writing for 10 
minutes a day or completing 
one short story a month. This 
helps build a regular writing 

habit without feeling 
overwhelmed.

Find a quiet, comfortable 
place where you can write 
without distractions. Having 
a dedicated writing space can 
help you get into the right 
mindset.

Writing prompts can spark 
creativity. Simple prompts 
like “Write about a memorable 
summer,” or “Describe your 
childhood home,” can get the 

creative juices flowing.

JOINING  
WRITING GROUPS

Writing groups offer sup-
port, feedback and a sense of 
camaraderie. Many communi-
ties have local writing groups 
that welcome new members, 
often hosted at libraries or 
community centers. Addition-
ally, online groups and 
forums can connect you with 

fellow writers from around 
the world.

Many community centers, 
senior centers and universi-
ties offer writing workshops 
specifically for seniors. These 
classes can provide structure, 
instruction and inspiration.

Websites like Writer’s 
Digest, Scribophile and The 
Writer offer resources, 
prompts and forums for writ-
ers of all levels. Online classes 
and webinars can also provide 
valuable learning 
opportunities.

SHARING YOUR WORK
For those interested in pub-

lishing their work, many 
self-publishing platforms 
make it easy to create and dis-
tribute books. Websites like 
Amazon Kindle Direct Pub-
lishing and Lulu offer 
user-friendly options for get-
ting your work out into the 
world.

Consider reading your work 
at local events or senior cen-
ters. Sharing your stories 
aloud can be a rewarding 
experience and a great way to 
connect with others.

Creative writing is a fulfill-
ing and enriching activity for 
seniors. It offers a way to 
keep the mind active, express 
emotions and connect with 
others. 

Whether you’re writing for 
yourself, your family, or a 
broader audience, the act of 
putting pen to paper can be 
deeply satisfying and benefi-
cial. So grab a notebook, find 
a quiet spot, and start explor-
ing the world of words. Your 
stories are waiting to be told.

Self Expression Through Writing
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SENIOR LIVING  |  DIGITAL COMMUNICATION

Communication today 
embraces more than 

words. It now includes 
a wide array of emojis 

— small icons that 
represent emotions, 

objects and ideas. 

While younger generations 
often use emojis fluently, 
seniors can benefit from 
incorporating these symbols 
into their digital conversa-
tions, especially when they 
want to connect with grand-
children. Learning what 
emojis mean and how to use 
them can enhance communi-
cation, making texting and 
social media more fun and 
expressive. 

UNDERSTANDING 
EMOJIS

Emojis are pictorial repre-
sentations used in digital 
communication to convey 
emotions, ideas or activities. 
They range from smiley faces 
and hearts to images of food, 
animals and activities. Emojis 
can add nuance and emotion 
to text, helping to convey the 
sender’s tone more clearly.

The meanings of emojis can 
vary, but many are intuitive. 
For example, a smiling face 
represents happiness, while a 
thumbs-up indicates approval. 
To understand the less obvi-
ous ones, seniors can use 
online resources like Emojipe-
dia, which offers detailed 
descriptions of each emoji. 
Additionally, many smart-
phones provide brief 
descriptions when you hold 
down or tap on an emoji 
before sending it.

Carla Bevins, a professor of 
business management 

communication at Carnegie 
Mellon University, suggests 
that the most direct and fun 
way to learn what an emoji 
means is to ask. “Your 

grandkids are the real experts 
and will be happy to give you 
a lesson. They may even teach 
you a few tricks you can use in 
your own messaging.”

HOW TO USE EMOJIS
Emojis can enhance text 

messages by adding emotional 
context. A simple “good morn-
ing” can feel warmer with a 

sun emoji or a coffee cup. Sim-
ilarly, using a heart can convey 
love and affection, while a 
laughing face can show humor.

Emojis are widely used on 
platforms like Facebook, Insta-
gram and X. They can make 
posts more engaging and relat-
able. For example, sharing a 
photo of a delicious meal 
might be complemented with a 
fork and knife emoji or a chef 
emoji. Emojis can be used in 
comments to express reactions 
quickly and visually.

While emojis are less com-
mon in formal emails, they can 
be appropriate in casual or 
personal messages. A well-
placed smiley or a thumbs-up 
can make an email feel friend-
lier and more personable. 
However, it’s best to avoid 
overusing emojis in profes-
sional communications to 
maintain a respectful tone.

TIPS FOR USING EMOJIS
Begin with basic and univer-

sally understood emojis like 
smiley faces, hearts️, and 
thumbs-up. These are easy to 
use and widely recognized.

Always consider the context 
of your message. Emojis can 
add a personal touch to con-
versations with family and 
friends but may not be suitable 
for all situations, especially 
formal or serious discussions.

While emojis are fun, using 
too many can make messages 
hard to read. Aim for a bal-
ance, using emojis to 
complement rather than over-
whelm your text.

New emojis are added regu-
larly. Staying updated with the 
latest additions can expand 
your emoji vocabulary and 
help you communicate more 
effectively. Regularly checking 
your smartphone’s emoji 
library can introduce you to 
new symbols.
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SENIOR LIVING  |  HEALTHY HOBBIES

Retirement marks a 
significant transition, 
offering the freedom 

to explore new 
interests and hobbies 
that may have been 

sidelined during 
one’s working years. 

Engaging in healthy hobbies 
during retirement provides a 
sense of purpose and pro-
motes physical, mental and 
emotional well-being. 

BENEFITS OF HOBBIES
Many hobbies — such as gar-

dening, swimming or yoga 
— encourage physical activity, 
which is crucial for maintain-
ing mobility, strength and 
overall health. Regular physi-
cal activity can help prevent 
chronic diseases, improve car-
diovascular health and boost 
energy levels.

Engaging in mentally stimu-
lating activities like reading, 
puzzles or learning a new lan-
guage helps keep the mind 
sharp and can reduce the risk 
of cognitive decline. Hobbies 
that challenge the brain 
enhance memory, prob-
lem-solving skills and 
intellectual agility.

Hobbies provide a sense of 
accomplishment and joy, 
reducing stress and promoting 
relaxation. Activities like 
painting, playing music or 
crafting offer creative outlets 
that can be deeply satisfying 
and therapeutic.

Many hobbies foster social 

interaction, which is essential 
for emotional health. Joining 
clubs, groups or classes related 
to your interests can help you 
meet new people, build friend-
ships, and combat loneliness.

EXPLORING  
NEW INTERESTS

Gardening is an excellent 
hobby for seniors. It combines 
physical activity with the 

therapeutic benefits of being 
outdoors and connecting with 
nature. Whether it’s tending to 
a small flower bed or cultivat-
ing a vegetable garden, the 
rewards are both tangible and 
fulfilling.

Exploring creativity through 
arts and crafts can be incredi-
bly rewarding. Activities like 
painting, knitting, pottery or 
woodworking allow you to 

express yourself and create 
beautiful, useful items. Many 
communities offer classes and 
workshops, providing oppor-
tunities to learn new skills and 
meet like-minded individuals.

Retirement provides the 
perfect opportunity to explore 
new places. Whether it’s trav-
eling to different countries or 
exploring local attractions, 
travel broadens horizons and 

creates lasting memories. Con-
sider joining travel groups 
specifically designed for 
seniors to enjoy safe and orga-
nized adventures.

Giving back to the commu-
nity can be a deeply enriching 
experience. Volunteering 
allows you to use your skills 
and knowledge to help others, 
providing a sense of purpose 
and fulfillment. There are 
countless opportunities to vol-
unteer, from tutoring children 
to working at local food banks.

It’s never too late to learn 
something new. Many retirees 
enjoy taking up new educa-
tional pursuits, whether it’s 
through formal classes, online 
courses or self-study. Learning 
a new language, taking up 
cooking classes or studying 
history or literature can keep 
the mind engaged and 
curious.

GETTING STARTED
Reflect on activities you’ve 

enjoyed in the past or have 
always wanted to try. Make a 
list of potential hobbies and 
explore each one to see which 
resonates most with you. Start 
small and gradually build your 
skills and knowledge. Setting 
achievable goals helps main-
tain motivation and provides a 
sense of progress.

Look for local clubs, classes 
or online communities related 
to your interests. Being part of 
a group offers support, inspi-
ration and social connections. 
Don’t be afraid to try new 
things and step out of your 
comfort zone. You may dis-
cover passions you never 
knew you had.

Find a New Passion
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SENIOR LIVING  |  HYDRATION

Staying hydrated 
unlocks good health at 
all ages, but it grows in 
importance as we age. 

Proper hydration helps 
maintain bodily functions, 
supports cognitive health and 
prevents various health issues. 

Water keeps the body run-
ning as it should, especially in 
such areas as digestion, tem-
perature regulation and the 
maintenance of healthy skin. 
Adequate hydration ensures 
that these processes work effi-
ciently, reducing the risk of 
digestive issues and maintain-
ing skin elasticity.

Dehydration can affect cog-
nitive function, leading to 
confusion, difficulty concen-
trating and memory 
problems. For seniors, staying 
hydrated can help maintain 
mental clarity and reduce the 
risk of cognitive decline.

Dehydration can lead to 
serious health problems. The 
National Council on Aging 
lists complications from dehy-
dration such as urinary tract 
infections (UTIs), heat stroke, 
heart problems, blood clot 
complications, kidney failure 
and kidney stones. Proper 
hydration helps to flush toxins 
from the body and keep the 
urinary system functioning 
smoothly.

Water helps to lubricate 
joints and maintain muscle 
function. Staying hydrated can 
alleviate joint pain and reduce 
the risk of cramps and strains, 
which is particularly import-
ant for seniors who may 

already experience joint 
issues.

CHALLENGES  
SENIORS FACE

As people age, the sensation 
of thirst can diminish, making 
it harder to recognize when 
the body needs water. This 
can lead to unintentional 
dehydration. A study out of 

the University of California, 
Los Angeles found that 40% of 
seniors are chronically 
dehydrated.

Many medications that 
seniors take can increase the 
risk of dehydration. Diuretics, 
for example, cause the body to 
lose more water, necessitating 
increased fluid intake.

Mobility issues can make it 

challenging for seniors to 
access water easily. Addition-
ally, some may limit their 
fluid intake to avoid frequent 
trips to the bathroom, further 
increasing the risk of 
dehydration.

TIPS FOR STAYING 
HYDRATED

Encourage regular fluid 

intake by setting a schedule. 
Drinking a glass of water with 
each meal and snack can help 
establish a routine. Keeping a 
water bottle nearby as a 
reminder can also be helpful.

Incorporate foods with high 
water content into the diet, 
such as fruits (watermelon, 
oranges, strawberries) and 
vegetables (cucumbers, let-
tuce, celery). These can 
contribute significantly to 
daily fluid intake.

If plain water isn’t appeal-
ing, try adding natural flavors 
like slices of lemon, lime, 
cucumber or a splash of juice. 
Herbal teas and broths are 
also good alternatives.

Keep track of daily water 
consumption to ensure that 
the recommended amount is 
being met. Most experts rec-
ommend about eight glasses 
of water per day, but this can 
vary based on individual 
needs and health conditions.

Limit the intake of caffeine 
and alcohol, as these can 
increase fluid loss. Instead, 
focus on beverages that con-
tribute to hydration.

Pay attention to signs of 
dehydration, such as dark 
urine, dry mouth, dizziness, 
muscle cramps in legs and 
arms and fatigue. If any of 
these symptoms occur, 
increase fluid intake 
immediately.

Staying proactive about 
hydration can lead to 
improved health outcomes 
and a better quality of life. So, 
make a habit of drinking 
water regularly and enjoy the 
benefits of staying 
well-hydrated.

Staying Hydrated as You Age
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SENIOR LIVING  |  TRAVEL TIPS

Travel can be one of 
the most enriching 
experiences at any 

age, and for seniors, it 
offers an opportunity 

to see new places, 
meet new people  
and create lasting 

memories. 

Many people look forward to 
retirement because it provides 
the opportunities to take longer 
trips and not have to worry 
about the stress of returning to 
work.

However, traveling as a 
senior can come with unique 
challenges. With some thought-
ful planning and a few practical 
tips, seniors can explore the 
world safely and comfortably.

PLANNING YOUR TRIP
Select destinations that cater 

to seniors with accessible 
accommodations, senior dis-
counts and medical facilities. 
Cities known for their accessi-
bility and senior-friendly 
attractions, such as Vancouver, 
Barcelona and Sydney, can be 
great choices.

Before planning any trip, 
check with your healthcare 
provider. Ensure your vaccina-
tions are up to date and discuss 
any health concerns or neces-
sary medications for your 
destination.

Make a list of your medica-
tions and pack enough to last 
the entire trip, plus a few extra 
days in case of delays. Keep 

medications in their original 
containers and bring a copy of 
your prescriptions. Consider 
purchasing travel insurance 
that covers health issues, 
including emergency medical 
evacuation.

TRAVEL ARRANGEMENTS
When booking flights, look 

for airlines that offer senior 
discounts. Choose flights with 

minimal layovers and conve-
nient times to reduce stress 
and fatigue. Request assistance 
at the airport if needed, such as 
wheelchair services or help 
with luggage.

Book accommodations that 
are accessible and comfortable. 
Look for hotels with amenities 
like elevators, ground-floor 
rooms and easy access to din-
ing and transportation. Read 

reviews and call ahead to con-
firm that your needs will be 
met.

Plan your ground transporta-
tion in advance. Renting a car? 
Ensure it’s easy to drive and 
accessible. Prefer public trans-
portation? Research options for 
seniors and accessible routes.

DURING YOUR TRIP
Keep a list of emergency 

contacts and share your travel 
itinerary with family or 
friends. Carry a cell phone 
with international service or a 
local SIM card to stay in 
touch.

Maintain hydration and a 
balanced diet. Carry a water 
bottle and healthy snacks. Be 
mindful of local water safety 
and opt for bottled water if 
necessary.

Don’t over-schedule your 
days. Allow time for rest and 
relaxation to avoid exhaus-
tion. Plan activities with 
plenty of breaks and choose 
tours that cater to seniors with 
a slower pace.

Be aware of your surround-
ings and keep your belongings 
secure. Use hotel safes for 
valuables and carry a copy of 
important documents like 
your passport and travel 
insurance.

ENGAGING  
WITH THE CULTURE

Engage with local culture 
through guided tours, cooking 
classes and cultural perfor-
mances. Many destinations 
offer senior-friendly activities 
that provide enriching experi-
ences without excessive 
physical exertion.

Take advantage of senior 
discounts on attractions, 
transportation and dining. 
Always ask if a senior rate is 
available; it can lead to signifi-
cant savings.

Consider joining a group 
tour designed for seniors. 
These tours often provide a 
balanced itinerary, group 
camaraderie, and the support 
of experienced guides.

Safe and Comfortable Travel
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